
North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 0780 Fireproofing - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Warco Construction
Alpha Insulation & 

Waterproofing

BASE BID $164,380.00 $74,415.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A

Total With Alternates $164,380.00 $74,415.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-14

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 0810 D/F/H - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Cook & Boardman, LLC 
dba Martin Architectual 

Production

Engineering Specialties 
Co.

BASE BID $878,228.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A

Total With Alternates $878,228.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 0830 Overhead Doors - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Custom Door & Gate
Maxson & Associates, 

Inc
Miner, LTD

BASE BID $76,200.00 $124,000.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A $0.00

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A $0.00

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A $0.00

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A $0.00

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A $0.00

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A $0.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A $0.00

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A $0.00

Total With Alternates $76,200.00 $124,000.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-14 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 0940 Terrazzo - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Concordia Building 
Company

David Allen Company

BASE BID $569,605.00 $422,937.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00 N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00 N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00 N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00 N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System $0.00 N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile $0.00 N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00 N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00 N/A

Total With Alternates $569,605.00 $422,937.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 0960 Resilient/Carpet - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Brock Contract Services Carpet Queen A.B. Denning Central Flooring LLC Furnish My Place
Atlanta Flooring 
Design Centers

Coverings Group
Terry's Floor 

Fashions

BASE BID $941,130.00 $1,232,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $839,145.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile ($184,200.00) $47,000.00 $96,505.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A $0.00 N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A $0.00 N/A

Total With Alternates $756,930.00 $1,279,000.00 $935,650.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4 3-5 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-16 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES NO YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 0970 Wood Flooring - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Foster Specialty Floors H2I Group, Inc
Royalwood Associates 

Inc
Brock Contract Services Southern Flooring Inc

BASE BID $228,373.00 NO BID $261,917.00 NO BID $208,000.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00 N/A N/A

Total With Alternates $228,373.00 $261,917.00 $208,000.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-14 9-16 9-15

Bid Signature YES YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A N/A N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 0990 Painting - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

United Painting 
Services

Venecon Kenna Custom Painting
A&A of NC dba 
Diamond Touch 

Construction
Kenna Custom Painting

BASE BID $597,326.00 $475,500.00 $745,750.00 $678,250.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A $0.00 N/A $0.00

Total With Alternates $597,326.00 $475,500.00 $745,750.00 $678,250.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-5 3-5 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-14 9-16 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES YES YES YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1000 Specialties - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Cook & Boardman dba 
Martin Architectural 

Products
Nycom Inc Precision Walls Inc

BASE BID $476,000.00 $410,000.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A
Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls

N/A N/A

Total With Alternates $476,000.00 $410,000.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-14 9-13

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1010 Markerboards/Visual Displays - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Cook & Boardman dba 
Martin Architectural 

Products
Nycom Inc Precision Walls Inc

Virginia School 
Equipment

BASE BID $169,100.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A

Total With Alternates $169,100.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1020 Signage - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

SignalFactors, LLC dba 
Modulex carolinas

AOA Signs

BASE BID $91,900.00 $198,670.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A

Total With Alternates $91,900.00 $198,670.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1050 Lockers - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Learning Environments 
Scott Equipment & 

Surfacing
Nycom, Inc. Precision Walls, Inc

BASE BID NO BID $95,800.00 NO BID NO BID 

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A

Total With Alternates $95,800.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-14

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1070 Prefab Canopies - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Mitchell Metals, LLC
Peachtree Protective 

Covers
B&C Awnings

Maxson & Associates, 
Inc

Walt Dittmer & Sons

BASE BID NO BID $316,555.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00

Total With Alternates $316,555.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-13

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1170 Athletic Equipment - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

H2I Group, Inc. Blankenship Associates Learning Environments
Schultz Industries Inc 

dba Sturdisteel 
Company

Scott Equipment & 
Surfacing

Virgina School 
Equipment

BASE BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $996,000.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A

Total With Alternates $996,000.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-14

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1230 Educational Casework - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Blankenship Associates Learning Environments Nycom, Inc

BASE BID $969,021.00 NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A

Total With Alternates $969,021.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES 



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1240 Lab Casework - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Blankenship Associates Learning Environments Nycom, Inc

BASE BID $542,295.00 NO BID $664,000.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A

Total With Alternates $542,295.00 $664,000.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-13

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1260 Auditorium Seating - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Universal Equipment 
Company

Learning Environments
Virginia School 

Equipment

BASE BID NO BID $128,100.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A

Total With Alternates $128,100.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1280 Media Center Furnishings - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Interior Systems Learning Environments Blankenship Associates

BASE BID NO BID NO BID $83,720.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A

Total With Alternates $83,720.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 2305 HVAC Testing and Balancing - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Airflow Experts Integra 
Palmetto Air & Water 

Balance

BASE BID $110,350.00 NO BID $123,750.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00 N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00 N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00 N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00 N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00 N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System $0.00 N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile $0.00 N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware $0.00 N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00 N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00 N/A

Total With Alternates $110,350.00 $123,750.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 3240 Fencing - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Allied Fence Company 
of Raleigh

Frye Fence Company
Seegars Fence 

Company
Sierra Structures Dickerson Fencing Co

BASE BID NO BID $194,500.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $1,200.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System $0.00

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile $0.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware $0.00

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00

Total With Alternates $195,700.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-4

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-14

Bid Signature YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed N/A



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 3270 Site Concrete - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Estrello Construction 
Group

Raleigh East Concrete Advance Concrete Briegan Concrete Sullivan Eastern M&M Concrete

BASE BID NO BID NO BID $1,705,495.00 NO BID NO BID $1,200,000.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A $0.00

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A $0.00

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A $0.00

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A $0.00

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A $0.00

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System N/A $0.00

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition Tile N/A $0.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System Hardware N/A $0.00

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A $0.00

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A $0.00

Total With Alternates $1,705,495.00 $1,200,000.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES YES



North Garner Middle School - Release 2

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 3290 Landscaping - REBID Bid Date April 21, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Brightview Landscape 
Development

Ideal Landscaping
Mid-South Irrigation & 

Landscape
Southern Garden Cardinal Landscaping Davis Landscape

BASE BID $1,137,900.00 $1,424,000.00 NO BID $1,462,264.00 NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 14 Addressable Fire Alarm System $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition Tile $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System Hardware $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00 N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00 N/A N/A

Total With Alternates $1,137,900.00 $1,424,000.00 $1,462,264.00

Addenda Acknowledged 3-5 3-5 3-5

Clarifications Acknowledged 9-16 9-16 9-16

Bid Signature YES YES YES

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized YES YES YES

Bid Bond Attached and Signed YES YES YES


