
North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package -0240 Demolition/Abatement Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

D.H. Griffin Wrecking 
Company

EMR Services Foss Demolition
Jones Construction 

Enterprise's
Reclaim Company

BASE BID $589,300.00 $277,385.00 $868,900.00 $435,000.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A N/A N/A

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package -0300 Turnkey Concrete Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Briegan Concrete LLC Raleigh East Concrete Advance Concrete LLC
Estrello Construction 

Group
Skyrock Construction

BASE BID $5,139,500.00 $6,132,700.00 $4,585,646.00 $4,277,700.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A N/A N/A

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package -0310 Concrete Foundations Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Briegan Concrete LLC Raleigh East Concrete Advance Concrete LLC
Estrello Construction 

Group
Skyrock Construction

BASE BID $2,979,000.00 $4,087,000.00 $2,599,431.00 $2,544,700.00 $3,000,000.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package -0320 Concrete Slabs Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Briegan Concrete LLC Raleigh East Concrete Advance Concrete LLC CM Red
Estrello Construction 

Group
Skyrock Construction

BASE BID $2,264,000.00 $2,217,000.00 $2,092,286.00 NO BID $1,775,700.00 $1,800,000.00

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package -0500 Structural/Misc Steel - REBID Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

North State Steel SteelFab Of Virginia
Weldon Steel 
Corporation

Sanford Steel Corp

BASE BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls

Addenda Acknowledged

Clarifications Acknowledged

Bid Signature

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized

Bid Bond Attached and Signed



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 1410 Elevators - REBID Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Delaware Elevator Inc Resolute Elevator LLC
TK Elevator 
Corporation

BASE BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls

Addenda Acknowledged

Clarifications Acknowledged

Bid Signature

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized

Bid Bond Attached and Signed



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 2100 Fire Protection - REBID Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Allied Fire Protection ABL & Associates J&D Sprinkler Co.

BASE BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls

Addenda Acknowledged

Clarifications Acknowledged

Bid Signature

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized

Bid Bond Attached and Signed



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 2200 Plumbing - REBID Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

ABL & Associates D&L Plumbing
SPC Mechanical 

Corporation

BASE BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls

Addenda Acknowledged

Clarifications Acknowledged

Bid Signature

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized

Bid Bond Attached and Signed



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 2300 HVAC Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Mechworks Watco Corporation ABL & Associates
SPC Mechanical 

Corporation

BASE BID $9,221,000.00 $9,255,772.00 $8,897,000.00 NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A N/A

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 2600 Electrical Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Ace Electric Inc LL Vann Electric
Moonlite Electric & 
Construction Inc

Pitt Electric ORI LLC
All Phase Power & 

Controls
LJ Electrical Company SE&M Constructors D.W. Evans Electric KAD Construction Watson Electrical

BASE BID $16,981,941.00 NO BID $11,494,560.00 $9,838,000.00 $12,845,000.00 $12,971,400.00 $11,175,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-5 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 3100 Turnkey Site Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Allen Grading Company
Faulconer Construction 

Company
Fred Smith Company Hine Sitework Conti Civil RiverWILD Construction Sullivan Eastern Inc.

Barbour Brothers 
Construction

Bruce Allen Construction 
Company

Morgan Corp.

BASE BID $13,727,390.00 $12,450,600.00 NO BID $12,496,442.00 NO BID $12,613,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition Tile $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 3110 Grading Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Allen Grading Company
Faulconer Construction 

Company
Fred Smith Company Hine Sitework Conti Civil RiverWILD Construction Sullivan Eastern Inc.

Barbour Brothers 
Construction

Bruce Allen 
Construction 

Company
Morgan Corp.

BASE BID NO BID $11,866,420.00 $10,559,400.00 NO BID $10,580,442.00 NO BID $10,767,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 3210 Asphalt Paving Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Allen Grading 

Company

Faulconer Construction 

Company
Fred Smith Company Hine Sitework Conti Civil

RiverWILD 

Construction
Sullivan Eastern Inc. Triangle Grading & Paving

Barbour Brothers 

Construction

Bruce Allen 

Construction 

Company

Morgan Corp. Sunrock Industries

BASE BID NO BID NO BID $1,200,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,350,000.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes



North Garner Middle School - Release 1

Garner, NC

Bid Day Tabulation

Bid Package - 3300 Site Utilities Bid Date February 12, 2026 2:00 PM

BIDDER>>

Allen Grading Company Carolina Civilworks
Faulconer Construction 

Company
Fred Smith Company Hine Sitework

Bruce Allen Construction 
Company

Conti Civil
RiverWILD 

Construction
Sullivan Eastern Inc.

Barbour Brothers 

Construction
Morgan Corp.

BASE BID NO BID $1,555,852.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,290,000.00 NO BID NO BID

Alternate 1 Single Source Panic Device Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 2 Single Source Door Closer Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 3 Single Source Door Lock Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 4 Single Source Convection Oven Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 5 Single Source Food Processor Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 6 Single Source Serving Line Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 7 Single Source Non-Proprietary Elevator Control N/A N/A

Alternate 8 Preferred Web Based Digital Controls N/A N/A

Alternate 9 BAS Extended Warranty N/A N/A

Alternate 10 Single Source Security Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 11 Single Source Theatrical Lighting Dimmers & 
Control Board N/A N/A

Alternate 12 Single Source Access Control Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 13 Security Intrusion Detection Equipment N/A N/A

Alternate 15 Forbo Industries – Marmoleum Composition 
Tile N/A N/A

Alternate 16 Single Source Video Intercom System 
Hardware N/A N/A

Alternate 17 Single Type J Glazing at Gymnasium Exterior 
Windows N/A N/A

Alternate 18 Provide Metal Panel Fence System in lieu of 
Steel Guardrail at all Retaining Walls N/A N/A

Addenda Acknowledged 1-2 1-2

Clarifications Acknowledged 1-6 1-6

Bid Signature Yes Yes

MWBE Affidativs Attached, Signed, Notarized Yes Yes

Bid Bond Attached and Signed Yes Yes


