Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 - Re-Bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 0330 Polished Concrete

Bidder

Advanced Concrete
Coatings

Blair Duron
Restoration

v
David Allen Company

/
Brock Contract Services

Raleigh East Concrete

Base Bid

O BHID

ND BD

119 420,00

N BN

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

|45, 16100

Y,

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference Rooms

Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius Bar

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South & West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a, W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

0° A A

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-based

controls
Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access

controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire alarm

Addenda acknowledged

Clarifications

15,1

s
A

129,20

Bid Signature

MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

Bid Bond Attached and Signed

< TR




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-Bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

"= CLANCY
I&XTHEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 0710 Waterproofing/Sealants

Bidder

Atlantic Concrete
Service Inc.

Live Green

J.T. Murphy
Construction Inc.

Strickland
Waterproofing Co.

ABG Caulking &
Waterproofing

Myers Professional
Insulation

MPI Foam

Base Bid

209860.00

NIVESIIN

NO BID

| 496,412 .00

NO 81D

NO BT NO Bl

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

0

O

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference Rooms

Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius Bar

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South & West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a, W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

- ‘O\ ;?’#O

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-based
controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access

controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire alarm

Y

5-9

Addenda acknowledged 5-49

Clarifications 195,16, 1%,19, 19 19,06, 1F 19, 20
Bid Signature v r ' %

MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and ‘
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages) v v

Bid Bond Attached and Signed v s




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 - Re-Bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

"= CLANCY
IKTHEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 0780 Fireproofing

Bidder

v
GA Fire Proofing

Southern
Fireproofing Co.

v
Warco Construction

South Atlantic
Fireproofing
Enterprise

Southern Fireproofing
Co.

Base Bid

11036400

ND GO

947, 330.00

NO HID

NO 61D

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

/
Y

0

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius

Bar
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,
W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-

based controls
Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access

controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire
alarm

Addenda acknowledged

5-9

Clarifications

19,20

5,17 18

Bid Signature

MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

K

Bid Bond Attached and Signed




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid) { CL ANCY

Location: Apex, NC l &THEYS

Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 0830 Overhead Doors
Bidder Maxson and Custom Door &
Associates, Inc. Gate
Base Bid NO BID 16586000
7
Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls 0O

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference
Rooms

Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius
Bar

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &
West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,
W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single \
Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-
based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater
dimming and controls

Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access
controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire
alarm

Addenda acknowledged

Clarifications 19,1

Bid Signature
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

Bid Bond Attached and Signed

< (N
-
MRS

< SIS




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-Bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

"e=CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 0840 Aluminum/Glass

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

0

v
. Carolina Classic MSJ Glass & .
Bidder Window & Glass Glazing, Inc. hslgi)l:,t?gr\l,: S}f‘ (S:S J&H GI?ISIS(’: Company
Base Bid 2 3,3120.00] 1. F49,500.9) WO BIO N BID
7 7 ’
O

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

\

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

v

v

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference
Rooms

+ 10,947 .00

4,900

Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius

O

+ 0

Bar
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

+ 221,000

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,
W24b

¥ 2_55,,(9@0
136 474

r 39 00

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

0]

4 o

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-

based controls
Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access
controls

“—

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire

alarm

Addenda acknowledged 5 -9 H- ﬂ
Clarifications 5,06,03 1% 14,20 | 19,[6,F 18112
. . 7 7 M N 7 7T

Bid Signature v v
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and e %
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)
Bid Bond Attached and Signed “ '\,/




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

"= CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Bid Package: 0930 Hard Tile

Bidder

Diamond Touch
Construction

Terry’s Floor
Fashions

A.B. Denning Inc.

Brock Contract
Services

Lomax Tile & Marble,
Inc.

TileSetters of Raleigh

David Allen Company

Base Bid

NO HID

NGO BID

NO - B

NO GBI

NO BI

/U0 A1)

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius

Bar
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,
W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single

Source
Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-
based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access
controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire
alarm

Addenda acknowledged
Clarifications |, 1 (§, 4,20
Bid Signature v ’
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and —
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

—

Bid Bond Attached and Signed




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

v

CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Bid Package: 0940 Terrazzo

Bidder

Blair Duron
Company

David Allen
Company

Base Bid

o HIO

O

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

0

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius

Bar
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,
W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

L272 .06].00

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single

Source
Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-

based controls
Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access
controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire

v

alarm

Addenda acknowledged

5-9

Clarifications

15,06, (.18

Bid Signature

+

MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

Bid Bond Attached and Signed

v
v
-




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

"= CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 0950 Acoustical Tile

Bidder

A.B. Denning Inc.

Ve
Acousti Engineering

Company

P WAl

Brock Contract
Services

Divisions Contractors

Interiors Unlimited,
Inc.

Northedge, LLC

Paul Barbour & Son

Precision Walls, Inc.

Base Bid

NI

L,065 9910V
Wféﬁ&&w

NO D

NO b1

O BIY

o B/

N =1,

VO B/

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

L4

)

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius

Bar
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,
W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

N

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

0

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

+7294,159.00

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

o

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

\

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single

Source
Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-
based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access
controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire

@

alarm

Addenda acknowledged

Clarifications

Bid Signature

MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

Bid Bond Attached and Signed




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

v

CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Bid Package: 0990 Painting

A
Bidd v Diamond Touch National Coatings, /
racet Construction Inc. Venecon
Base Bid . , O A 00
ase Bi Lol (1§00 PO B 657,400
Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls o + F50. o0

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

¥ 0

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

o

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

r (p 50

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius

Bar

o

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

O

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,

W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

-350."

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

_ 1]200 (11}

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-

based controls
Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access

controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire
alarm

Addenda acknowledged

{

5-9

Clarifications

0
gg: o
s
S
S

Bid Signature

13 - 20

MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

Bid Bond Attached and Signed




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 - Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

CLANCY

I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 1000 Specialties

7/
Bidder Am%r;gzr&(i:fety Martlrll)ﬁ)gcfgsectural Nycom Inc. Precision Walls, Inc. | Sterling Constructions TCS
Services
Base Bid o B No BID | o Bl N Bl

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

4,73, 000."
0

(44,57 9
O

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

|

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

\

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius
Bar

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,
W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single

Source
Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-

based controls
Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access

controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire

alarm

¥
Addenda acknowledged S - q 5-9
Clarifications 5 - 19 19-20
Bid Signature v L
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and w o
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages) ‘
Bid Bond Attached and Signed w —




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

FCLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 1010 Markerboards/Visual Displays

e

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls

o

/ RIS N i .Y
Bidd N | P Walls, I Sterling C / TCS \Y% School VOIVED etee] patin
idder ycom Inc recision Walls, Inc. terling Construction irginia Schoo ; hertcurone .
Services Equipment Mot AvE ! A (CUivent) 4 V\N’/V‘vf 3/‘:} %M‘ﬁ
proso
Base Bid oD AD N O 5D NO DID 2027600{00 NOBI) Wi b7 I L%Ol,{lzqﬁw %O@igl_{ooo
O © O

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings

|

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius

Bar
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &

West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,

W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single

Source
Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-
based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access
controls

bt

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire
alarm

Addenda acknowledged

5 -1

Clarifications

15-14

Bid Signature

MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and
Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)

No AP ERNAYT

e

Bid Bond Attached and Signed

v

NO BD @OND




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC
Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

"= CLANCY

I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 1020 Signage

. v . Poblocki Sign .. \/. )
Bidder AOA Signs, Inc Company LLC Precision Walls, Inc SignalFactors, LLC Signature SignCraft Solutions
pany dba Modulex Architectural Signage
. v , Q
Base Bid lL.{'}/QQCZOOO nNo D (D Ao BID 202}‘{@08} 0 BID
Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls o o
Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings O
Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy 9)
Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference
Rooms T _'} ZO
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius
Bar o

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South &
West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a,

W24b
Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single

Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single

Source
Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-
based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater

dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access

controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire
alarm

a
} N
N

Addenda acknowledged 5 9

Clarifications \S -20 nomae
Bid Signature v v
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and

Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages) \/ , v
Bid Bond Attached and Signed v v




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 - Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC

Owner: Wake County Public Schools

Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

"= CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 1070 Prefabricated Canopies

.,ﬁ
J/
Bidder Mitchell Metals, Peachtree Protective Perfection Walt Dittmer & Sons,
! LLC Covers, Inc. Architectural Inc dba Dittmer
Systems Architectural Aluminum
Base Bid NERID, L/ * LRI PO Bl
026500 | M b O

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating &

Walls 0
Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site 0
Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

*100,676.00

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

o

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at

Genius Bar
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-

South & West
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades -

W24a, W24b
Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single
Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment

Single Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for

web-based controls
Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for
theater dimming and controls

Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for

access controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for
fire alarm

Addenda acknowledged 5-4
Clarifications 5, U, 13, 13
Bid Signature Vv '
MBE Affidavits Attached,

Signed and Notarized (Affidavit v

A is 2 pages)

Bid Bond Attached and Signed v




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid) "™ CLANCY

Location: Apex, NC l&THEYS

Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 1170 Athletic Equipment
v N e
. Blankenship Learning Scott Equipment and TCS Virginia School
Bidder : . . .
Associates Environments Surfacing Equipment

Basc Bid 555 810.%| N A W%%,Wﬂw 213 400,76 'SERZ0)

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating &

Walls o O %
Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site \
Furmishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference
Rooms

Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at
Genius Bar

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-
South & West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades -
W24a, W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single
Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment
Single Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for
web-based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for
theater dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for

access controls
Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for
fire alarm \L J’ v
Addenda acknowledged 5 -0 5 =0 5-9
Clarifications 19,1, 318, 11,20 1S, 06, 17 15 -20
Bid Signature / v v
MBE Affidavits Attached,

Vv v L

Signed and Notarized (Affidavit
A is 2 pages)
Bid Bond Attached and Signed \/ v v




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid) r gl CL ANCY

Location: Apex, NC l&THEYS

Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 1230 Educational Casework

4 Blankenship Institutional Tops 4

Associates Company

Base Bid q 37_/(_} 50’00 f\) 0 HIb 82(/{, 56300

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating &

Walls O 0
Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site

Furnishings 0 1

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy O L

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms O
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at .

Genius Bar i + "{5 s 6(77,00 + 3]} 250'00
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-

South & West 0O J
Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades -
W24a, W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Bidder Nycom Inc.

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single
Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment
Single Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for
web-based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for
theater dimming and controls

Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for
access controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for R
fire alarm

Addenda acknowledged 59 5- &}

Clarifications ($-20 -2 o

Bid Signature \Y
MBE Affidavits Attached, / %
Signed and Notarized (Affidavit \/

A is 2 pages) /
Bid Bond Attached and Signed




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid)

Location: Apex, NC

Owner: Wake County Public Schools

Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm

v

CLANCY
I&THEYS

CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

Bid Package: 1260 Auditorium Seating

Bidder Interior Systems, Learning Universal Virginia School

! Inc Environments Equipment Equipment
Company

Base Bid NO A0 NOBID 568/000 00 NOED)

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating &
Walls

a

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site

\

Furnishings

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

|

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference

Rooms
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at
Genius Bar

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-
South & West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades -

W24a, W24b
Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single

Source
Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment

Single Source
Alternate 02.10 Security System Single

Source
Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for
web-based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for
theater dimming and controls

Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for

access controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for v

fire alarm

Addenda acknowledged nong
Clarifications 15 -20
Bid Signature v’
MBE Affidavits Attached,

Signed and Notarized (Affidavit v
A is 2 pages)

Bid Bond Attached and Signed v’




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid) ’ CL ANCY

Location: Apex, NC l &THEYS

Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 1330 Grandstands and Bleachers

v/

Schultz Industries, Southern Bleacher
Inc. Company

Base Bid A B NO BID No BID 3(03} 050.%

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating &

Walls O
Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site
Furnishings

Learning

Bidder : Gt Grandstands )
Environments

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference
Rooms

Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at
Genius Bar

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-
South & West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades -
W24a, W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single
Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment
Single Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for
web-based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for
theater dimming and controls

Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for
access controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for
fire alarm N,

Addenda acknowledged 5-0)
Clarifications 5,10, [+ 1B
5

Bid Signature

MBE Affidavits Attached,
Signed and Notarized (Affidavit

A is 2 pages) v
Bid Bond Attached and Signed




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-bid) ’ CL ANCY

Location: Apex, NC l &THEYS

Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm & CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 3270 Site Concrete

. Central Concrete of v
Bidder NC Honducom Conerete | gaterfield Paving Skyrock Construction

Base Bid Mo B 1 958 ,013.00 | NO BiD NO Bl

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating &
Walls + 95, F7+.C0

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site
Furnishings O
Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy 3 l 5 OO

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference
Rooms

Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at

Genius Bar 0
Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-
South & West

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades -
W24a, W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling /
Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single

Source

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment
Single Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single
Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for
web-based controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for
theater dimming and controls
Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for
access controls

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for
fire alarm

Addenda acknowledged ] 9@

Clarifications 15-20
v

Bid Signature

MBE Affidavits Attached, S
Signed and Notarized (Affidavit

A is 2 pages)
Bid Bond Attached and Signed v




Project Name: H12 Felton Grove High School (RELEASE 3 — Re-Bid) "= CLANCY

Location: Apex, NC '&THEYS

Owner: Wake County Public Schools
Bid Opening: March 14, 2023 3:00 pm CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
Bid Package: 3290 Lowd S€aping
N vy

Bidder DUNK Landsed i \Dé&tL Lawelgapiiy Mid SO A ‘;WMJ Ahp¥
Base Bid 7, 150[000 00 \G{Om }26000 2/?2“%/‘7{00,00

e

Alternate 01.1 Courtyard Seating & Walls O @) )

Alternate 01.2 Courtyard Site Furnishings + 5¥ !0 00 + 4 ‘8/'700 t b 6/ 2] (76 00

Alternate 01.3 Main Entrance Canopy 0 D

Alternate 02.1 Stand Alone Conference Rooms !

Alternate 02.3 Exterior Sunshades-South & West

0
Alternate 02.2 Built-In Countertops at Genius Bar \ \

Alternate 02.4 Vertical Sunshades - W24a, W24b

Alternate 02.5 Luxury Vinyl Tile

Alternate 02.6 Terrazzo Flooring

Alternate 02.7 Wood Veneer Paneling

Alternate 02.8 Door Hardware-Single Source

Alternate 02.10 Security System Single Source

Alternate 02.11 Preferred supplier for web-based
controls

Alternate 02.12 Preferred supplier for theater
dimming and controls

Alternate 02.13 Preferred supplier for access
controls

Alternate 02.9 Kitchen Equipment Single Source l /

Alternate 02.14 Preferred supplier for fire alarm

Addenda acknowledged 959 o -9 5 '0\
) (5- 20 \S - 2.0

Clarifications |

Bid Signature v’
MBE Affidavits Attached, Signed and o v’ o~
N

Notarized (Affidavit A is 2 pages)
Bid Bond Attached and Signed




